
Aloe MSM Gel
When you’re looking for soothing relief, reach 
for Aloe MSM Gel. MSM stands for Methyl 
Sulfonyl Methane, an organic sulfur found in 
almost all living organisms. In fact, sulfur is the 
third most abundant substance in our body.

The other main ingredient in Aloe MSM Gel 
is pure, stabilized Aloe Vera. Aloe MSM Gel 
combines these two powerful ingredients with 
herbal extracts and other select ingredients for 
soothing relief anytime. Try Aloe MSM Gel 
today!

DIRECTIONS:

Apply liberally and massage into skin areas 
where needed. Should eye contact occur, flush 
with water for several minutes. Repeat applica-
tion as needed.

INGREDIENTS:

Aloe Barbadensis Leaf Juice (Stabilized Aloe 
Vera Gel/gel d’aloès officinal stabilisé), Water 
(Aqua), Dimethyl Sulfone (MSM), Glycerin, 
Triethanolamine, Dimethicone, Arctostaphylos 
Uva Ursi Leaf Extract, Sodium Hyaluronate, 
Allantoin, Tocopherol (Natural Vitamin E/
vitamine E naturelle), Melaleuca Alternifolia 
(Tea Tree) Leaf Oil, Rosmarinus Officinalis 
(Rosemary) Leaf Extract, Salix Alba (Willow) 
Bark Extract, Polysorbate 80, Ascorbic Acid, 
Carbomer, Disodium EDTA, Methylparaben, 
Diazolidinyl Urea.

CONTENTS

4 Fl. Oz. (118 ml)

•	 Clear,	non-staining	formula

•		For	soothing	relief	anytime

•		Contains	pure,	stabilized	Aloe	Vera	
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